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CAE supports both Royal Canadian Air Force and Royal Australian 
Air Force participation in Coalition Virtual Flag exercise 
 
-- Coalition forces from US, UK, Canada and Australia train together in 
distributed, integrated live-virtual-constructive (LVC) exercise --  
 
 
Montreal, Canada, September 14, 2016 – (NYSE: CAE; TSX: CAE) – CAE recently supported both 
the Royal Canadian Air Force (RCAF) and Royal Australian Air Force (RAAF) as they participated in 
Coalition Virtual Flag 16 (CVF16), one of the world’s largest virtual air combat exercises. 
 
Hosted by the United States Air Force, CVF16 took place in mid-August so that simulated aircraft 
could participate in the joint, multi-national air combat training exercise. Aircrews from the United 
States, United Kingdom, Australia, and Canada participated.   
 
“These kinds of distributed mission training exercises, often involving both live and virtual assets, are 
becoming more critical as militaries and coalition partners look to cost-effectively prepare for 
operations and maintain readiness,” said Gene Colabatistto, CAE’s Group President, Defence & 
Security.  “CAE brings a great deal of expertise and experience as a training systems integrator to 
help enable defence forces to conduct distributed mission operations and increasingly leverage more 
virtual training as part of these exercises.” 
 
Royal Canadian Air Force 
 
CAE assisted the RCAF’s 426 Squadron at 8 Wing Trenton and the Canadian Forces Air Warfare 
Centre (CFAWC) in the preparation, planning and execution of the RCAF’s participation in CVF16.  
The RCAF’s 426 Squadron flew a CAE-built CC-130J full-mission simulator as part of the exercise 
where the RCAF had responsibility for performing a range of airland and airdrop missions, including 
the insertion of Special Operations Forces (SOF) assets.  CAE’s computer-generated forces software 
provided added realism by generating numerous enemy virtual threats, such as SU-27 fighters and 
ground-based surface-to-air missiles, as well as a range of friendly forces.  In total, CAE’s simulation 
software provided more than 2,000 computer-generated constructive and virtual entities in the 
synthetic environment. 
 
“Our participation in Coalition Virtual Flag was highly relevant and proved that these type of distributed 
virtual exercises provide valuable tactical training at the basic and advanced levels,” said Captain 
Jason Danyluk, CC-130J pilot and CVF mission lead for the RCAF.  “We look forward to our continued 
participation in Coalition Virtual Flag exercises and exploring the various training opportunities this 
level of simulation can provide to the RCAF and our allies.” 
 
Royal Australian Air Force 
 
The RAAF’s CAE-built C-130J full-flight mission simulator (FFMS) along with a C-130J tactical airlift 
crew trainer (TACT), both located at RAAF Base Richmond in New South Wales, took part in CVF16.  
CAE supported the integration, networking and testing of the FFMS and TACT into the Coalition 
Virtual Flag exercise. 
 
“This is our second year participating in Coalition Virtual Flag and we continue to learn a lot of lessons 
and overcome various technical challenges to improve the immersive quality of the training,” said Wing 



Commander Jason Baldock, 285 Squadron, Royal Australian Air Force.  “A big step forward this year 
was linking the C-130J tactical airlift crew trainer with the C-130J full-mission simulator so that the 
entire C-130J crew could be immersed in the same training environment. CAE was instrumental in 
providing the technical guidance and expertise in making this possible.”  
 
About CAE 
 
CAE’s Defence & Security business unit focuses on helping prepare our customers to develop and 
maintain the highest levels of mission readiness. We are a world-class training systems integrator 
offering a comprehensive portfolio of training centres, training services and simulation products across 
the air, land, sea and public safety market segments. We serve our global defence and security 
customers through regional operations in Canada; the United States/Latin America; Europe/Middle 
East/Africa; and Asia/Pacific, all of which leverage the full breadth of CAE’s capabilities, technologies 
and solutions. 
 
CAE is a global leader in training for the civil aviation, defence and security, and healthcare markets. 
Backed by a 70-year record of industry firsts, we continue to help define global training standards with 
our innovative virtual-to-live training solutions to make flying safer, maintain defence force readiness 
and enhance patient safety. We have the broadest global presence in the industry, with 8,000 
employees, 160 sites and training locations in over 35 countries. Each year, we train more than 
120,000 civil and defence crewmembers and thousands of healthcare professionals worldwide. 
www.cae.com 
 
Follow us on Twitter @CAE_Inc and @CAE_Defence 
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