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CAE USA awarded subcontract from Lockheed 
Martin to develop C-130J simulators for AFSOC 

 

 
Tampa, Florida, USA, May 21, 2020 – (NYSE: CAE; TSX: CAE) – CAE 
USA has been awarded a subcontract from Lockheed Martin to support the 
design, development and manufacture of three C-130J full-mission 
simulators for the United States Air Force Special Operations Command 
(AFSOC). 
 
Two of the simulators will be specifically for the MC-130J variant which is a 
multi-mission transport and special operations tanker operated by AFSOC.  
The other simulator will be reconfigurable between the MC-130J and EC-
130J, a variant used for information operations by AFSOC.  
 
“The longstanding relationship between Lockheed Martin and CAE on the 
design and development of training systems for the C-130J Super Hercules 
and its variants has proven to be a great partnership for more than two 
decades now,” said Ray Duquette, President and General Manager, CAE 
USA.  “The high-fidelity simulation capabilities of these MC-130J and EC-
130J full-mission simulators will enable Air Force Special Operations 
Command to continue increasing the use of synthetic training across the 
overall training curriculum, which contributes to the safe and cost-effective 
readiness of the aircrews.” 
 
The MC/EC-130J full-mission simulators will be full-motion and accurately 
simulate the aircraft and its various missions.  The full-mission simulators 
recreate the sounds, motion, virtual environment and all other aircraft 
systems required to provide a high-fidelity, realistic flight training 
environment.  These three MC/EC-130J simulators will be delivered to 
various air bases in 2023. 
 
Lockheed Martin and CAE have designed and developed a range of C-130J 
training systems for all branches of the United States Air Force, including 
Air Mobility Command, Air Combat Command, Air National Guard and 
AFSOC.  
 
About CAE 
 
CAE’s Defense & Security business unit focuses on helping prepare our 
customers to develop and maintain the highest levels of mission readiness.  
We are a world-class training systems integrator offering a comprehensive 
portfolio of training centers, training services and simulation products 
across the air, land, sea and public safety market segments.  We serve our 
global defense and security customers through regional operations in the 
United States/Latin America; Canada; Europe/Africa; and Asia-
Pacific/Middle East, all of which leverage the full breadth of CAE’s 
capabilities, technologies and solutions. 
 

 

 
CAE USA will design and manufacture 

additional MC-130J and EC-130J  
full-mission simulators for the Air Force 

Special Operations Command. 
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CAE is a global leader in training for the civil aviation, defense and security, 
and healthcare markets. Backed by a record of more than 70 years of 
industry firsts, we continue to help define global training standards with our 
innovative virtual-to-live training solutions to make flying safer, maintain 
defense force readiness and enhance patient safety. We have the broadest 
global presence in the industry, with over 10,500 employees, 160 sites and 
training locations in over 35 countries. Each year, we train more than 
220,000 civil and defense crewmembers, including more than 135,000 
pilots, and thousands of healthcare professionals worldwide. www.cae.com   
 
Follow us on Twitter @CAE_Inc and @CAE_Defence 
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CAE contacts: 
 
Hélène V. Gagnon, Vice President, Public Affairs and Global Communications, 
+1-514-340-5536, helene.v.gagnon@cae.com 
 
Trade media:  
Chris Stellwag, Director, Marketing Communications – Defense and Security,  
+1-813-887-1242, chris.stellwag@cae.com  
 
Investor relations:  
Andrew Arnovitz, Vice President, Strategy and Investor Relations, 
+1-514-734-5760, andrew.arnovitz@cae.com 
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